RFQ 12-12-2018Q Paint Products and Supplies

Tabulation

Dunn-Edwards
Corporation

SEMI GLOSS ACRYLIC LATEX INTERIOR

Lowe's

PPG
Architectural
Finishes, Inc.

The Sherwin-
Williams Co.

5 GALLON $70.36 $63.06 $68.99 $67.99
1 GALLON $15.30 $14.13 $13.99 $14.59
SEMI GLOSS ACRYLIC LATEX EXTERIOR
5 GALLON $70.36 $93.60 $72.99 $67.99
1 GALLON $15.30 $19.48 $14.99 $14.59
5 GALLON $67.27 S47.28 $62.99 $49.95
1 GALLON $13.93 $10.62 $12.99 $11.09
5 GALLON $70.88 $84.14 $76.99 $49.95
1 GALLON $14.24 $18.69 $15.99 $14.29
WALL PRIMER EXTERIOR STUCCO
5 GALLON $70.88 $84.14 $76.99 $99.95
1 GALLON S14.24 $18.69 $15.99 $20.99
5 GALLON $70.36 $143.20 $84.99 $67.99
1 GALLON $15.30 $31.18 $16.99 $14.59
5 GALLON $70.36 $180.00 $92.99 $67.99
1 GALLON $15.30 $40.80 $18.99 $14.59
5 GALLON $71.39 $133.00 $86.99 $123.95
1 GALLON $14.81 $29.58 $17.99 $25.79
5 GALLON $77.79 $118.40 $121.99 $63.95
1 GALLON $15.29 $26.38 $23.99 $13.79
5 GALLON $77.79 $118.40 $121.99 $63.95
1 GALLON $15.29 $26.38 $23.99 $13.79

EXTERIOR FLAT STUCCO,MASONRY,WOOD,VINYL ACRYLIC




RFQ 12-12-2018Q Paint Products and Supplies

Tabulation
PPG
Dunn-Edwards Architectural The Sherwin-
Corporation Lowe's Finishes, Inc. Williams Co.
5 GALLON $66.87 $79.19 $61.99 $68.95
1 GALLON $15.29 $17.59 $12.99 $14.79
5 GALLON $68.89 $79.19 $63.99 $78.95
1 GALLON $14.62 $17.59 $13.99 $16.79
5 GALLON $100.28 No Bid $91.99 $96.45
1 GALLON $19.32 No Bid $18.99 $20.29
5 GALLON $115.54 $94.64 $45.99 $171.45
1 GALLON $24.71 No Bid $9.99 $35.29
PERMA WHITE SEMI-GLOSS I N I
5 GALLON $114.18 No Bid $72.99 $83.95
1 GALLON $23.14 No Bid $14.99 $17.79
5 GALLON $114.18 No Bid $69.99 $78.95
1 GALLON $23.14 No Bid $14.99 $16.79
5 GALLON $114.18 No Bid $78.99 $78.95
1 GALLON $23.14 No Bid $15.99 $16.79
123 PRIMARY SEALER (BULLSEYE)
5 GALLON $91.88 $77.34 $86.99 $99.95
1 GALLON $18.70 $21.24 $17.99 $20.95
LATEX LOW SHEEN VERSA SATIN
5 GALLON $71.39 $58.78 $78.99 $81.45
1 GALLON $14.81 $14.06 $15.99 $16.79
LACQUER SANDING SEALER NITRO N I A R
5 GALLON $99.96 No Bid $78.99 $96.45
1 GALLON $21.17 No Bid $15.99 $20.29
DECOLAC HS LACQUER GLOSS
5 GALLON $83.91 No Bid $82.99 $96.45




RFQ 12-12-2018Q Paint Products and Supplies

Tabulation

PPG
Dunn-Edwards Architectural The Sherwin-
Corporation Lowe's Finishes, Inc. Williams Co.
1 GALLON $18.05 $31.96 $16.99 $20.29
RUST SCAT LATEX HIGH GLOSS
5 GALLON No Bid No Bid $99.99 $153.95
1 GALLON $32.79 $35.71 $21.99 $31.79
5 GALLON $73.21 No Bid $68.99 $73.95
1 GALLON $15.29 $18.22 $14.99 $16.29
5 GALLON $48.78 No Bid $64.99 $55.00
1 GALLON $8.29 $13.02 $13.99 $10.99
5 GALLON $17.04 $12.30 $21.99 $15.19
1 GALLON $5.26 $5.71 $10.99 $4.99
ASTROSHIELD EXTERIOR SEMI GLOSS
5 GALLON $211.92 $180.00 $110.99 $153.95
1 GALLON $43.11 $40.80 $22.99 $31.79
5 GALLON $211.92 No Bid $110.99 $153.95
1 GALLON $43.11 $39.98 $22.99 $31.79
CELLULOSE ACETATED BUTYRATE (ACRYLICLACQUER) [T Y
5 GALLON No Bid No Bid No Bid $148.95
1 GALLON $28.81 No Bid No Bid $30.79
DISCOUNT ON SUPPLIES OFF OF CATALOG PRICING 5-65% 23.90% 30% 20%
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